POLICY
ANALYSIS

JaNuary 8, 2026 NuMBER 1009

Understanding Debanking

Evaluating Governmental, Operational, Political,

and Religious Financial Account Closures

By NICHOLAS ANTHONY

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

his study examines the growing phenomenon of
debanking—the sudden and often unexplained
closure of individuals’ or organizations’ financial
accounts. While media and political narratives
often attribute these closures to political or religious
discrimination, this study finds that the majority of
debanking cases stem from governmental pressure. To
identify this cause more accurately, the study distinguishes

between four forms of debanking—governmental,

——
o

operational, political, and religious—evaluating each form in
turn. Based on public evidence, governmental debanking
appears to be the most significant issue. Congress can correct
this issue by reforming the Bank Secrecy Act, repealing
confidentiality laws, and permanently ending reputational
risk regulation. Doing so would reduce the incentives to
debank, expose how widespread debanking has become, and
cut out the tools that the government has used to pressure

banks and other financial institutions.

\
J // NICHOLAS ANTHONY is a policy analyst at the Cato Institute’s Center for Monetary and Financial Alternatives.
y



INTRODUCTION

Debanking can be a frustrating and nerve-racking
experience. A sudden notice from the bank announces that
you have 30 days to collect your money and find another
bank. You panic. What could you have done wrong?

You paid your bills on time (or at least most of the time).
What could have caused this change? You call to ask the
bank, and you’re told there’s nothing more that can be
said. You're left in the dark.

On the other side of the line, however, bankers are often
stuck between a rock and a hard place because they are
bound by confidentiality. In some cases, it’s possible that

even customer service representatives are not allowed to

know what took place to justify the account closure. Bankers

generally recognize these requirements as part of anti—
money laundering, know your customer, and countering
the financing of terrorism regulations (often abbreviated
as AML, KYC, and CFT regulations). Yet, the public is rarely
aware of these requirements.' This divide has created
frustration on both sides.

If Congress wants to bring relief and reduce the
debanking phenomenon, it’s time to eliminate the
confidentiality that has shrouded the system. It’s time
to take the practice of reputational risk regulation off
the table. And it’s time to reform the Bank Secrecy Act
regime that has deputized financial institutions as law

enforcement investigators.

DEBANKING EXPLAINED

In the most basic sense, debanking is simply the
sudden closure of a financial account. This experience is
usually associated with banks, but it can happen with
other financial institutions as well (e.g., credit unions,
exchanges, payment apps, etc.). With that said, there
are also several subcategories of debanking to consider.
The most infamous case of debanking—Operation Choke

Point—can be described as governmental debanking.

The contrast to that is operational debanking.” In addition,

some groups have recently claimed the existence of both
political and religious debanking.?

To better understand the dynamics at play, it helps to
look at how these different forms of debanking have taken

shape—and how easily they can be conflated.

Governmental Debanking

Governmental debanking is what occurs when the
government pressures a financial institution to close a
customer’s account.* Governmental debanking can occur
in two forms. The first form occurs when the government
directly instructs a financial institution to close an account.
This instruction can be as casual as a letter or as formal as
a court order. The second form, however, is more indirect.
Itinvolves the use of laws and regulations to make it
increasingly more difficult to serve customers.

Let’s consider a few examples.

The case of National Rifle Association (NRA) v. Vullo made
headlines in 2018 after Maria T. Vullo, superintendent
of the New York State Department of Financial Services,
issued regulatory guidance instructing financial
institutions to review relationships with the NRA and “take
prompt actions” to manage the risk of being associated
with the organization.® Vullo joined with then—New York
Governor Andrew Cuomo to say that the government
“urges all insurance companies and banks. .. to join
the companies that have already discontinued their

”6

arrangements with the NRA.”® This example is a case of

direct governmental debanking.

“If Congress wants to bring

relief and reduce the debanking
phenomenon, it’s time to
eliminate the confidentiality that
has shrouded the system.”

In another example, the Federal Deposit Insurance
Corporation (often abbreviated as FDIC) sent private
letters to instruct financial institutions to stop conducting
cryptocurrency-related activity.” Some people may
take comfort in the fact that the agency only told these
institutions to “pause all crypto asset-related activity.”
Financial institutions, however, know all too well that the
government’s suggestions are rarely optional.® Furthermore,
the agency failed to provide a timeline or follow up with
those financial institutions.’ So, in practice, these letters
were effectively termination orders. Again, this example is a

case of direct governmental debanking.



Finally, yet another example occurred when companies
sending money between the United States and Somalia
quickly found themselves debanked in 2015 after “a broad
US crackdown on money laundering.”'® At the time, the
Office of the Comptroller of the Currency ordered a bank to
shut down these accounts unless the bank could “maintain
sufficient transparency to reasonably ensure the legitimacy
of the sources and uses of customer funds.” Unfortunately
for the companies, the cost-benefit analysis of tracking
funds and increasing supervision was not in their favor, and
their accounts were closed—marking another case of direct

governmental debanking.

“While criminal activity should not
go unchecked, these reports rarely
catch actual wrongdoers.”

Examples of governmental debanking are not always
so direct. Sometimes they take on a more indirect form.
Rather than explicitly order the closure of specific accounts,
the government makes it economically infeasible to serve
customers by increasing regulatory costs.

One example of indirect governmental debanking occurs
when financial institutions close accounts after a customer
incurs too many suspicious activity reports (often abbreviated
as SARs). These reports were established under the Bank
Secrecy Act regime such that financial institutions must
report customers when they do something out of the norm."
While criminal activity should not go unchecked, these
reports rarely catch actual wrongdoers. For example, one
of the most common reasons for filing a suspicious activity
report is that a customer made a transaction close to $10,000,
as doing so could be considered a purposeful attempt to avoid
the threshold for filing a currency transaction report (often
abbreviated as CTR)." Yet, each report still counts against a
customer because financial institutions can face hundreds
of millions of dollars in fines if it turns out that someone was
indeed breaking the law and the accounts were not closed.”
In effect, the incentives push financial institutions to be more
sensitive than they might otherwise be.

Another example of indirect governmental debanking
occurs when banks have left high-risk areas. In one report,

the Government Accountability Office found that the rules

under the Bank Secrecy Act required banks working near
the southwest border to conduct “more intensive account
monitoring and investigation of suspicious activity.”**
Eventually, the compliance costs (and the risks) became
high enough that these banks closed their branches in the
area and shut down accounts. More recently, the Trump
administration tried to increase financial surveillance at the
border so severely that affected businesses would likely have
had to shut down under the new regulatory costs had the
order not been stopped by the courts.”

Finally, Operation Choke Point was an example of both
direct and indirect governmental debanking. Originally led
by the Department of Justice, the operation began with the
intent of targeting fraudulent businesses but was quickly
used to target payday lenders, pawn shops, gun shops, state-
licensed cannabis dispensaries, and other businesses.®

One of the key tools in Operation Choke Point was the
regulation of reputational risk."”” As the name suggests,
this practice involves shifting the focus of regulators away
from traditional factors found on a financial institution’s
balance sheet and toward broader issues such as negative
publicity.'® When it came to the question of who might
present a higher risk to the financial institution’s reputation,
the Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation at one point
named 30 different categories of businesses.”” Despite this list
describing mostly legal businesses, the message was clear:
Doing business here meant facing higher scrutiny, higher
compliance costs, and a higher chance of enforcement actions.

Taken together, these examples show that governmental
debanking occurs when the government orders or otherwise

effectively forces financial institutions to close accounts.

Operational Debanking

Operational debanking is what occurs when a financial
institution chooses to close the account of a customer
because it is no longer in the institution’s interest. It could
be because the customer violated part of their contract
with the institution or because the institution itself
decided to move in another direction.

Let’s consider a few examples.

Bank of America made headlines in 2018 when it
announced that it was stepping away from certain gun

manufacturers.? According to reporting at the time, this



decision was made after discussions with employees

and customers who had been affected by high-profile
shootings.” Notably, however, gun manufacturers were not
cut off from the entire financial system.?* Bank of America
only closed some accounts, while it maintained accounts
with other gun manufacturers (e.g., Remington and Vista
Outdoor). Furthermore, the affected manufacturers could
still open accounts elsewhere. So while it seems that Bank
of America saw the bad press as unprofitable, others saw
it as an opportunity—marking this example as a case of
operational debanking.

A similar case occurred in 2019 when JPMorgan Chase
announced it would no longer finance privately owned
prisons and detention centers.?® Again, this decision
appears to have been primarily a response to customers
and other members of the public who had protested at
shareholder meetings and even in front of JPMorgan Chase
CEO Jamie Dimon’s apartment.** And again, the privately
owned prisons were not cut off all at once or from the entire
financial system. Instead, JPMorgan Chase reduced its credit

exposure over time.*®

“The most well-known claim of
political debanking occurred
shortly after protestors entered
the US Capitol on January 6,2021.”

With that said, most cases of operational debanking are
unlikely to make headlines. A less controversial (though
likely more common) example occurs when a financial
institution closes an account after repeated overdrafts, late
payments, or failure to maintain the account. Put simply, the
account holder didn’t pay for the service, so the institution
stopped offering it. Although banking has become more
accessible in recent years as banks have introduced services
like overdraft forgiveness and entry-level accounts, there
are still times when the cost of offering a service exceeds the
benefit. Banks should be free to assess those cases and make
the decision whether to close an account.

Taken together, these examples show that operational
debanking occurs when financial institutions choose to close

accounts as part of their own internal decisionmaking.

Political Debanking

Political debanking is the idea that financial institutions
close accounts solely because they are discriminating
against a customer’s political party or identity. Although
many things can be described as political in nature and cross
over into other forms of debanking, the core requirement for
“political debanking” as defined here is that a customer was
explicitly targeted for their political beliefs. In practice, cases
of political debanking have almost exclusively involved
claims that conservatives are being targeted.*® However,
many of these cases actually appear to be examples of
governmental debanking.

Let’s consider a few examples.

The most well-known claim of political debanking occurred
shortly after protestors entered the US Capitol on January 6,
2021. More than 300 accounts associated with the Trump
Organization were reportedly closed.”” Although Eric Trump
has said this experience “was a clear attack on free speech”
and “those who dare to express their political views,” these
closures coincided with a period in which then—former
President Donald Trump and his associates were facing civil
and criminal investigations.”® With this context in mind, it
seems much more likely that the closures were really a case of
governmental debanking because financial institutions did
not want to be caught on the wrong side of the law.

A second, and closely related, example occurred when
January 6 protestors were debanked. One study described
the closing of these accounts as examples of the “growing
weaponization of the financial system to target groups and
individuals that engage in disfavored political speech.”*
However, again, the context cannot be ignored. These
individuals were at the center of one of the most high-profile
legal controversies in recent history. According to one lawyer
for the defendants, the Federal Bureau of Investigation and
Justice Department were “prodding financial institutions
to treat [January 6 protestors] like domestic terrorists.”*°
In this case, it again seems more likely that the closures were
cases of governmental debanking.

Finally, another example occurred when conservative
political commentator Michael Knowles took to social media
to reveal he was having issues receiving payments.* Knowles
shared how he received a vague message that there was a
problem with his account and that customer support had him

going in circles. Facing frustration, Knowles wrote, “I can only



conclude that they’ve now decided that certain conservative
opinions amount to ‘illegal’ activity.”* Yet, it seems that what
really happened was not political debanking. One day later,
Knowles shared that the real reason his account was closed
was “a government administrative error.”** Again, it seems
this instance was likely a case of governmental debanking.
Other cases do exist, but there is not enough public
information to reliably assess what may have taken
place.** With that said, these examples show that political
debanking may be a misdiagnosis. While it’s possible that
political discrimination exists, much more evidence is

needed to ascribe it as the motive for widespread debanking.

Religious Debanking

Religious debanking is the idea that financial institutions
close accounts solely because they are discriminating against
a customer’s religion. In practice, cases of religious debanking
have largely centered around claims that Christians have
been targeted and discriminated against by financial
institutions.*® However, looking beyond these claims, publicly
documented cases have been few and far between.*® And even
then, it seems that these cases may actually be examples of

governmental debanking or even operational debanking.

“While headlines said, ‘Big Banks
Discriminate Against Christian
Ministries, Churches,’ it seemed
the real source of the issue was
unknown.”

One such case occurred in 2023 when a group of
accounts associated with a nonprofit—Indigenous Advance
Ministries—working to spread Christianity in Uganda
was closed.” In response, Jeremy Tedesco, senior counsel
and senior vice president for corporate engagement at the
Alliance Defending Freedom, said, “No American should
have to worry that a financial institution will deny them
service based on their religious beliefs, but Bank of America
appears to have done just that with Indigenous Advance.”*®

While such an occurrence would be troubling, it later

came to light that one of the accounts was being used for a

debt-collection agency in Uganda and that this information
had not been disclosed to the bank.*® Operating a high-risk
business in a high-risk jurisdiction would likely have posed
significant compliance costs. Therefore, it’s unlikely that the
issue was with the organization’s Christian beliefs. Given
that these costs are incurred under the Bank Secrecy Act
regime, it’s likely that this example leans toward being a
case of governmental debanking. However, it’s also possible
that elements of operational debanking were present,
given that the failure to disclose the business could have
jeopardized the business relationship.*°

Another example occurred in 2022 when the National
Committee for Religious Freedom had its accounts closed.*!
While headlines said, “Big Banks Discriminate Against
Christian Ministries, Churches,” it seemed the real source of

42 “We can’t really ascribe a motive

the issue was unknown.
to this,” said the National Committee for Religious Freedom
in one interview. “We don’t know. But if it is religion, that
should be frowned upon.”** However, here too, something
strange happened. Additional reporting revealed that the
bank was willing to keep the accounts open so long as the
organization answered questions related to its 501(c)4

tax status.** Yet, the organization refused. Considering

the accounts could have been reopened, this case walks a
fine line in terms of being labeled debanking. However, it
appears to lean toward a case of governmental debanking
since the problems stemmed from an issue of oversight—
something banks cannot legally choose to ignore.

While Christian organizations do not appear to have
faced widespread issues, reports have shown that Muslim
people are more than twice as likely as the general public
to face issues with financial institutions.* However, again,
it’s not clear that the issue is one of faith. What may be
more likely is an issue of geography.*® One survey found
that the problems for Muslim customers disproportionately
stemmed from issues with international transactions,
sending money, and keyword flagging. Sending money to
family and friends should be an easy endeavor, especially
in the digital era. However, having friends and family in
high-risk jurisdictions can quickly run afoul under the
Bank Secrecy Act regime. In that case, the issue is more so
governmental debanking than religious debanking.

Taken together, these examples show that religious

debanking may also be a misdiagnosis.



Different Forms Do Overlap

While these labels are helpful, it is important to be
mindful that there is some overlap between the different
forms of debanking. For example, navigating the regulatory
costs incurred under the Bank Secrecy Act is part of a
business’s strategic decisionmaking. Still, because those
costs stem directly from government intervention, cases of
debanking due to Bank Secrecy Act compliance concerns are
therefore governmental in nature. Similarly, cases of fraud
cover both forms of debanking. While suspicious activity
reports are filed for cases of suspected fraud, financial
institutions would likely cut ties with customers who lie
about their details even without the legal requirement.
Another grey area occurs when some organizations are both
political and religious in nature. Finally, there is a fine line to
draw when assessing operational and political debanking.
It would be an operational response to accept the calls of
protesting customers to debank a disfavored group, but
such a response would veer into political debanking if the
protestors were calling for the institution to close accounts
solely based on political affiliations. Disentangling the
driving motivation for debanking in such cases is not always
easy. Therefore, whenever assessing different forms of
debanking, care should be taken to recognize the nuances of

each situation.

WHAT TO MAKE OF DEBANKING

Based on the available evidence, Congress should
prioritize responding to governmental debanking. There are
three key reasons for this strategy.

First, governmental debanking is the most pressing
issue. The majority of cases over time can be found where
government officials have intervened in the market by
either directly or indirectly telling banks how to run their
business. And the public recognizes it. Although legislation
introduced by Republican members of Congress has
centered on restricting the conduct of private businesses,
72 percent of conservative citizens saw government
intervention as the main issue here.*” Furthermore,
governmental debanking is where Congress has the most
control and the best ability to fix the issue.

Second, political and religious debanking appear to

be almost nonexistent. Out of 8,361 account closure

complaints reviewed by Reuters, only 35 complaints

» o« » «

mentioned the words “politics,” “religion,” “conservative,”
or “Christian.”*® And even where they may exist, the

cases appear to be far more complicated than headlines
suggest.*” The example of Indigenous Advance Ministries
is an illustrative case study of this phenomenon. Although
claims of religious discrimination were used to justify
pushing state policymakers to restrict access to the
financial system, the root issue appears to be that the sole
organization cited as an example had not disclosed to the
bank that it set up a debt-collection agency in Uganda.*°
Congress should resist intervening until, at the very least,

more evidence can be collected.

“The majority of cases over
time can be found in cases of
government officials intervening
in the market by either directly or
indirectly telling banks how to run
their business.”

Third, Congress may still be tempted to intervene in
operational debanking, but private businesses should be
free to make their own decisions, even if it means they face
negative consequences from customers. When surveyed,
74 percent of conservatives said banks should be free to
make their own decisions because regulatory interventions
requiring otherwise could lead to unintended
consequences.” The misguided approach in the Fair Access
to Banking Act is an illustrative example.** In the worst
case, the bill responds to government pressure on financial
institutions by further restricting what those institutions
are allowed to do.

By focusing efforts on governmental debanking,
Congress can defend Americans’ economic freedom,
avoid creating new distortions, and act where it has both
the authority and the responsibility to make meaningful
change. For the individuals suddenly locked out of
their accounts, the distinction between governmental
and operational debanking can make all the difference.
Congress should focus reforms where it can truly restore

fairness and transparency.



RECOMMENDATIONS

Congress should take a targeted approach to address
the problem of debanking—one that both exposes how
widespread debanking has become and removes the tools
that the government has used to pressure banks and other
financial institutions. Both Congress and state policymakers
should resist calls to turn banks into utility services by
mandating access to accounts. Likewise, policymakers should
resist calls to permit account closures only when the risks can
be quantified. A notable example of these mistakes can be
seen at the state level in Tennessee where a 2024 law made
itillegal to deny services based on factors that cannot be
quantified.> Instead, Congress should establish transparency,
end reputational risk regulation, and remove the incentives to

debank that have been created under the Bank Secrecy Act.

Establishing Transparency

To expose how widespread debanking has become,
Congress should repeal the confidentiality requirements
that prevent financial institutions from telling customers
why their accounts were closed. Time after time, customers
have reported feeling helpless because banks say they
are not allowed to reveal why accounts were closed.** For
example, after one customer learned that his account was
closed due to “unexpected activity,” the bank refused to
say more about the exact cause for termination other than
that “financial institutions have an obligation to know our
customers and monitor transactions.”*®

Such confidentiality requirements are particularly relevant
in the case of suspicious activity reports. Under current law, it
isillegal under 31 U.S.C. Section 5318(g) (2) for a bank to share
a suspicious activity report with the customer. In fact, it’s even
illegal to confirm the existence of such a report. When these
reports are the reason for an account closure, the bank should
have the freedom to share that information with the customer.

To be clear, so long as banks are still required to file
suspicious activity reports under the Bank Secrecy Act
and are at risk of being held at fault if they miss a report,
“all their incentives are towards closing accounts.”*® The
difference, however, is that customers will actually be
allowed to know the root cause of the issue.

While members of Congress may be tempted to go further

and force financial institutions to explain their actions, this

path is unnecessary. If a financial institution chooses to leave
customers in the dark even after these reforms, it potentially
will be at their own peril as they become known for being
unreliable. Congress should therefore remove this veil of
confidentiality and leave the rest to the market. To achieve
this end, Congress should repeal 31 U.S.C. Section 5318(g) (2),
12 U.S.C. Section 3420(b), and 18 U.S.C. Section 1510.

“Congress should take a targeted
approach to address the problem of
debanking—one that both exposes
how widespread debanking has
become and removes the tools
that the government has used to
pressure banks and other financial
institutions.”

Another important issue involves “confidential supervisory
information,” as these materials can be used to pressure
financial institutions to change their conduct and relationships
with customers. Yet, it is illegal to share this information
under current law. Congress got it right when it crafted 18
U.S.C. Section 1906 and prohibited regulators from sharing
supervisory materials. Things started to go wrong, however,
when the Federal Reserve “asserted a legal theory” that these
materials belong to the government “even when [they are]
produced by the banks and even when the banks themselves
are eager to disclose [them].””” That is backward. Banks should
have the ultimate say over how this information is shared.

Congress should instruct the Federal Reserve to reform
12 C.F.R. Part 261 and instruct the Federal Deposit Insurance
Corporation to reform 12 C.F.R. Part 309 so financial
institutions that are the subject of confidential supervisory
information may share that information as they see fit.*® Doing
so would go along way in adding transparency that would

help better identify whether additional reforms are needed.

Ending Reputational Risk Regulation

Great strides have been made to take reputational risk

regulation off the books. Regulators have announced that



they will cease the practice, Congress has introduced

legislation to prohibit the practice, and President Donald

Trump has issued an executive order calling for an end to the

practice.* Still, more is needed to ensure that this cycle does

not repeat again. The best way to do so is for Congress to

enact legislation that limits the actions of regulators by law.
To take this tool off the table for good, Congress should

use the following language:

()  IN GENERAL.—If a government official formally
or informally requests or orders a financial institution
to terminate a specific customer account or a group of
customer accounts, the government official shall—
(A) provide such request or order to the financial
institution in writing; and
(B) accompany such request or order with a
written justification for why such termination is
needed, including any specific laws or regulations the
government official believes are being violated by the
customer or group of customers, if any.
(2)  JUSTIFICATION REQUIREMENT.—A justification
described under paragraph (1) (B) may not be based on the
reputational risk to the financial institution.
(3) ELIMINATION OF REPUTATIONAL RISK.—No
Federal banking agency may engage in any activity
concerning or related to the regulation, supervision,
or examination of the reputational risk, or any term
substantially similar, or the management thereof, of a
depository institution, including—
(A)  establishing any rule, regulation, requirement,
standard, or supervisory expectation concerning
or related to the reputational risk, or any term
substantially similar, or the management thereof, of a
depository institution whether binding or not;
(B) conducting any examination, assessment, data
collection, or other supervisory exercise concerning or
related to reputational risk, or any term substantially
similar, or the management thereof, of a depository
institution;
(C) issuing any examination finding, supervisory
criticism, or other supervisory or examination
communication concerning or related to reputational
risk, or any term substantially similar, or the

management thereof, of a depository institution;

(D) making any supervisory ratings decision or
determination that is based, in whole or in part, on any
matter concerning or related to reputational risk, or any
term substantially similar, or the management thereof,
of a depository institution; and

(E) taking any formal or informal enforcement
action thatis based, in whole or in part, on any matter
concerning or related to reputational risk, or any term
substantially similar, or the management thereof, of a

depository institution.®°

Establishing this process will both take reputational risk
factors off the table and create a much-needed paper trail

should concerns arise again.

Removing Incentives to Debank

Congress should also reform the larger Bank Secrecy
Act regime.® While the costs of this system have been
evident in the cases of accounts closed, the money spent on
compliance, and the privacy lost, the government has yet to
provide compelling evidence that these impositions deliver
meaningful benefits.®* Repealing the Bank Secrecy Act,
repealing the reporting requirements, or even just reforming
the reporting requirements could all go a long way in
changing the incentives financial institutions face.

Congress has three options when it comes to removing these
incentives. First, at a minimum, all the thresholds for reports
required under the Bank Secrecy Act should be adjusted for
inflation. For example, the $10,000 currency transaction report
threshold should be adjusted to at least $86,000 to account
for the inflation that has taken place since the Bank Secrecy
Act was first passed in 1970. Some members of Congress have
introduced legislation in recent years to move toward this goal,
but more support is needed to make this change a reality.

Legislative language that would make the full adjustment

reads as follows:

The Secretary of the Treasury (referred to in this section as
the “Secretary”) shall take the following actions:
()  Notlater than 180 days after the date of
enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall—
(A)  amend part 1010 of title 31, Code of Federal

Regulations, or any successor regulations, such



that, with respect to each instance in that part

in which the threshold for filing a transaction in

currency is more than $10,000, such threshold

becomes more than $86,000;

(B)  amend section 1020.320(a) (2) of title 31,

Code of Federal Regulations, or any successor

regulation, by striking “$5,000” and inserting

“$11,000”;

(C)  amend section 1022.320(a)(2) of title 31, Code

of Federal Regulations, or any successor regulation,

by striking “$2,000” and inserting “$4,000”;

(D)  amend section 1022.320(a) (3) of title 31,

Code of Federal Regulations, by striking “$5,000”

and inserting “$10,000”;

(E)  amend section 1010.306 of title 31, Code

of Federal Regulations, by striking “$10,000” and

inserting “$86,000”;

(F)  amend section 1010.330 of title 31, Code

of Federal Regulations, by striking “$10,000” and

inserting “$30,000”;

(G)  amend section 1010.340 of title 31, Code

of Federal Regulations, by striking “$10,000” and

inserting “$86,000”; and

(H)  amend section 1.6050I1-1 of title 26, Code

of Federal Regulations, by striking “$10,000” and

inserting “$31,000.”
(2)  With respect to each amount amended under
paragraph (1), the Secretary shall adjust that amount
annually to reflect the annualized percentage increase in
the personal consumption expenditures price index, as
indicated in the Gross Domestic Product, Fourth Quarter
report released by the Bureau of Economic Analysis of
the Department of Commerce for the applicable year
(referred to in this section as the “BEA report”), which the
Secretary shall round to the nearest $1,000.
(3)  The Secretary shall provide that each adjustment
described in paragraph (2) shall be made on the date
that is 30 days after the date on which the applicable

BEA report is released.

Yet, adjusting the thresholds is akin to treating the
symptom instead of the cause. The Fourth Amendment does
not say that people have a right to be secure in their papers

unless it involves a lot of money. For its second option,

Congress should eliminate the reporting requirements
entirely. If such a change were made, law enforcement could
still go after actual criminals. They would just need to get a
warrant to prove they have a legitimate need for someone’s
records. To do so, Congress should first repeal 31 U.S.C.
Sections 5313-16, 31 U.S.C. Section 5318(a)(2), 31 U.S.C.
Section 5318A, 31 U.S.C. Section 5324, 31 U.S.C. Section 5326,
31 U.S.C. Sections 5331-32, 31 U.S.C. Section 5336, 31 U.S.C.
Sections 5341-42, 31 U.S.C. Sections 5351-55, 26 U.S.C.
Section 60501, 12 U.S.C. Section 3413(b)—(r), 12 U.S.C. Section
3414, and 12 U.S.C. Section 3402(2), (4), and (5).°

To amend the remaining pieces, Congress should use the

following language®*:

Declaration of Purpose.—Subchapter II of chapter 53 of
title 31, United States Code, is amended by striking section
5311 and inserting the following:
()  “85311. Declaration of purpose
“Itis the purpose of this subchapter (except section
5315) to—
(A) require financial institutions to retain
transaction records that include information
identified with or identifiable as being derived from

the financial records of particular customers.”

Even then, eliminating half the regime would not solve
all the problems. Issues including know-your-customer
requirements, transnational repression, derisking, and
debanking all tie back to these laws.® Therefore, the third
option for Congress is to repeal the entire Bank Secrecy
Actregime. That would permit banks to decide what
information they need, whom they do business with, and
what risks they take on. It would still be illegal to knowingly
assist criminal activity, and law enforcement would still be

able to get a warrant should an investigation justify it.

CONCLUSION

Debanking is difficult to address. Between layers of
confidentiality and the sensitivity of financial relationships,
fully understanding what’s taking place is difficult. That is
why Congress should prioritize limiting the government’s
role in debanking and promoting the transparency needed

to understand the full scope of debanking.



NOTES

1. In one survey, the vast majority of respondents thought
that the government should need a warrant to obtain
their financial records. Cato Institute, “Cato Institute 2022
Financial Privacy National Survey,” September 2022.

2. Nicholas Anthony, “Two Types of Debanking: Operational
and Governmental,” Cato at Liberty (blog), Cato Institute,
February 4, 2025.

3. Nicholas Anthony, “Trump’s Debanking Order Calls for
Investigation, Something Tennessee Should Have Done,”
Cato at Liberty (blog), Cato Institute, August 7, 2025.

4. Operation Choke Point is the most infamous example of
governmental debanking. This report only highlights other
examples to provide more individual cases. Iain Murray,
“Operation Choke Point: What It Is and Why It Matters,”
Competitive Enterprise Institute, July 2014.

5. National Rifle Association of America v. Vullo, No. 22-842
(U.S.2024); and Maria T. Vullo to Chief Executive Officers
or Equivalents of All Insurers Doing Business in the State
of New York, “Guidance on Risk Management Relating

to the NRA and Similar Gun Promotion Organizations,”
memorandum, New York State, April 19, 2018.

6. New York State Department of Financial Services,
“Governor Cuomo Directs Department of Financial Services
to Urge Companies to Weigh Reputational Risk of Business
Ties to the NRA and Similar Organizations,” press release,
April 19, 2018.

7. History Associates Inc. v. FDIC, No. 1:24-cv-1857-ACR (D.D.C.
2024).

8. Allysia Finley, “Debanking and the Return of Operation
Choke Point,” Wall Street Journal, December 15, 2024.

9. Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation, Office of Inspector
General, “FDIC Strategies Related to Crypto-Asset Risks,”
October 2023.

10. Ryan Tracy, “Bank to Close Accounts Related to Somalia,”
Wall Street Journal, February 4, 2015.

11. The most common reasons for filing a suspicious activity
report include transactions below the $10,000 threshold
for a suspicious activity report, situations in which the
bank doesn’t know where a customer got their money, and
transactions that do not have an obvious purpose. Nicholas
Anthony, “Reporting FinCEN’s Suspicious Activity, Again,”
Cato at Liberty (blog), Cato Institute, July 9, 2025.

10

12. Nicholas Anthony, “Reporting FinCEN’s Suspicious
Activity, Again,” Cato at Liberty (blog), Cato Institute, July 9,
2025.

13. As the Bank Policy Institute explained, “When a bank
files a structuring SAR on a customer, that customer
generally becomes designated as ‘high risk’ under banking
agency guidance, and agency examiners begin asking

the bank why the account remains at the bank.” Greg

Baer and Gregg Rozanksy, “It’s Time to Do Away with the
Obsolete Currency Transaction Report,” American Banker,
January 27, 2025; and Ben Walter, host, The Unshakeables,
podcast, season 2, episode 1, “America’s Strength in Small
Business,” Chase for Business and Ruby Studio, January 21,
2025.

14. Government Accountability Office, “Bank Secrecy Act:
Derisking Along the Southwest Border Highlights Need for
Regulators to Enhance Retrospective Reviews,” February 26,
2018.

15. Nicholas Anthony, “$200 Surveillance Raised to $1,000
Is Still Wrong,” Cato at Liberty (blog), Cato Institute,
September 16, 2025.

16. US House of Representatives, Committee on Oversight
and Government Reform, “The Department of Justice’s
‘Operation Choke Point’: Illegally Choking Off Legitimate
Business, Appendix Part 1 of 2,” May 29, 2014.

17. Julie Hill, “Why Government Shouldn’t Regulate
Reputation Risk at Banks,” Mercatus Center at George
Mason University, April 23, 2020.

18. “Guidance for Managing Third-Party Risk,” Federal
Deposit Insurance Corporation, March 23, 2024.

19. US House of Representatives, Committee on Oversight
and Government Reform, “The Department of Justice’s
‘Operation Choke Point’: Illegally Choking Off Legitimate
Businesses?,” May 29, 2014.

20. Tiffany Hsu, “Bank of America to Stop Financing Makers
of Military-Style Guns,” New York Times, April 10, 2018.

21. Rachel Louise Ensign, “Bank of America Cut Off Private
Prisons Weeks After Lending to One,” Wall Street Journal,
July 2, 2019.

22. Rachel Louise Ensign, “Bank of America Cut Off Private
Prisons Weeks After Lending to One,” Wall Street Journal,
July 2,2019.


https://www.cato.org/sites/cato.org/files/2022-09/Toplines_Financial%20Privacy_2022.pdf
https://www.cato.org/sites/cato.org/files/2022-09/Toplines_Financial%20Privacy_2022.pdf
https://www.cato.org/blog/two-types-debanking-operational-governmental
https://www.cato.org/blog/two-types-debanking-operational-governmental
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://cei.org/sites/default/files/Iain%20Murray%20-%20Operation%20Choke%20Point.pdf
https://www.supremecourt.gov/opinions/23pdf/22-842_6kg7.pdf
https://www.supremecourt.gov/opinions/23pdf/22-842_6kg7.pdf
https://www.supremecourt.gov/opinions/23pdf/22-842_6kg7.pdf
https://www.governor.ny.gov/sites/default/files/atoms/files/DFS_Guidance_on_Risk_Management_Relating_to_NRA_Gun_Manufacturers-Insurance_4.19.18.pdf
https://www.governor.ny.gov/sites/default/files/atoms/files/DFS_Guidance_on_Risk_Management_Relating_to_NRA_Gun_Manufacturers-Insurance_4.19.18.pdf
https://web.archive.org/web/20240327120118/https:/dfs.ny.gov/reports_and_publications/press_releases/pr1804191
https://web.archive.org/web/20240327120118/https:/dfs.ny.gov/reports_and_publications/press_releases/pr1804191
https://web.archive.org/web/20240327120118/https:/dfs.ny.gov/reports_and_publications/press_releases/pr1804191
https://www.fdic.gov/foia/history-associates-inc-v-fdic-fdics-redacted-pause-letters-january-3-2025
https://www.wsj.com/opinion/debanking-and-the-return-of-operation-choke-point-finance-money-government-8d507083
https://www.wsj.com/opinion/debanking-and-the-return-of-operation-choke-point-finance-money-government-8d507083
https://www.fdicoig.gov/sites/default/files/reports/2023-10/EVAL-24-01-Redacted.pdf
https://www.wsj.com/articles/bank-to-close-accounts-related-to-somalia-1423094674
https://www.cato.org/blog/reporting-fincens-suspicious-activity-again
https://www.cato.org/blog/reporting-fincens-suspicious-activity-again
https://www.cato.org/blog/reporting-fincens-suspicious-activity-again
https://www.americanbanker.com/opinion/its-time-to-do-away-with-the-obsolete-currency-transaction-report
https://www.americanbanker.com/opinion/its-time-to-do-away-with-the-obsolete-currency-transaction-report
https://podcasts.apple.com/us/podcast/jamie-dimon-americas-strength-in-small-business/id1725983618?i=1000684838562
https://podcasts.apple.com/us/podcast/jamie-dimon-americas-strength-in-small-business/id1725983618?i=1000684838562
https://www.gao.gov/products/gao-18-263
https://www.gao.gov/products/gao-18-263
https://www.gao.gov/products/gao-18-263
https://www.cato.org/blog/200-surveillance-raised-1000-still-wrong
https://www.cato.org/blog/200-surveillance-raised-1000-still-wrong
https://oversight.house.gov/wp-content/uploads/2014/05/Appendix-1-of-2.pdf
https://oversight.house.gov/wp-content/uploads/2014/05/Appendix-1-of-2.pdf
https://oversight.house.gov/wp-content/uploads/2014/05/Appendix-1-of-2.pdf
https://www.mercatus.org/research/policy-briefs/why-government-shouldnt-regulate-reputation-risk-banks
https://www.mercatus.org/research/policy-briefs/why-government-shouldnt-regulate-reputation-risk-banks
https://www.fdic.gov/news/inactive-financial-institution-letters/2008/fil08044a.html
https://oversight.house.gov/wp-content/uploads/2014/05/Staff-Report-Operation-Choke-Point1.pdf
https://oversight.house.gov/wp-content/uploads/2014/05/Staff-Report-Operation-Choke-Point1.pdf
https://oversight.house.gov/wp-content/uploads/2014/05/Staff-Report-Operation-Choke-Point1.pdf
https://www.nytimes.com/2018/04/10/business/bank-of-america-guns.html
https://www.nytimes.com/2018/04/10/business/bank-of-america-guns.html
https://www.wsj.com/articles/bank-of-america-cut-off-private-prisons-weeks-after-lending-to-one-11562059804
https://www.wsj.com/articles/bank-of-america-cut-off-private-prisons-weeks-after-lending-to-one-11562059804
https://www.wsj.com/articles/bank-of-america-cut-off-private-prisons-weeks-after-lending-to-one-11562059804
https://www.wsj.com/articles/bank-of-america-cut-off-private-prisons-weeks-after-lending-to-one-11562059804

23. David Henry and Imani Moise, “JPMorgan Backs Away
from Private Prison Finance,” Reuters, March 5, 2019.

24. David Henry and Imani Moise, “JPMorgan Backs Away
from Private Prison Finance,” Reuters, March 5,2019; and
Hugh Son, “Jamie Dimon Interrupted Twice by Shouting
Protesters at Goldman Banking Conference,” CNBC,
December 4, 2018.

25. Michelle F. Davis, “JPMorgan Ends Financing of Private
Prisons After Criticism,” Bloomberg, March 5, 2019.

26. High-profile claims of political debanking have been
made by Donald Trump, Kelly Loeffler, Michael Knowles,
Dana Rohrabacher, Ian Miles Cheong, the Constitution Party
of Idaho, Mercola Market, the Arkansas Family Council,
Moms for Liberty, and the Defense of Liberty Foundation.
Some commentators have claimed that rapper Kanye

West was debanked for political reasons, but the closures
came before his political controversies. West later revealed
that his accounts were being frozen at the same time by
the Internal Revenue Service because he owed the federal
government $50 million in taxes. Kelly Loeffler, “Political
Redlining: Kelly Loeffler Vows to ‘Get to the Bottom’

of Politicized Debanking,” interview by Larry Kudlow,
Kudlow, Fox News, August 26, 2025; Tony Ulrich, “US Bank
Canceled My Organization’s Account Without Explaining
Why,” RealClearMarkets, May 5, 2025; Jerry Cox, “Chase
Bank Cancels National Committee for Religious Freedom’s
Account Just Like It Canceled Family Council’s,” Family
Council, October 19, 2022; Brendon Leslie, “Retail Health
Company Has Chase Accounts Suddenly Terminated,
Owner Critical of COVID Vaccines, FDA,” Florida’s Voice,
July 25,2023; Michael Knowles (@michaeljknowles), “Hi,
@Stripe. Are we still doing this de-banking thing? Was it
something I said? If we say that men can’t be women, if we
donate to pro-life charities, if we oppose two men buying
eggs, renting wombs, and commoditizing babies. . . . Does
that come at the cost of de-banking?” X post, July 21, 2025,
7:09 p.m.; Dana Rohrabacher (@DanaRohrabacher), “I was
de-banked by @BankofAmerica too. Apparently, this is was
a far more extensive abuse of power than the public knows,
including those of us who were targeted for our political
beliefs. To add insult to injury, this from a bank who was the
recipient of tens of billions of dollars of taxpayer bailouts.,”
X post, January 23,2025, 10:02 p.m.; Lydia Nusbaum,
“PayPal Unfreezes Moms for Liberty Funds After DeSantis
Announces Crackdown on ‘Woke’ Banking,” Florida’s Voice,
August 1, 2022; Ian Miles Cheong (@ianmiles), “PayPal
just informed me that they have permanently banned

my account. Without giving an explicit reason why, the
supervisor was extremely rude and implied that it had
everything to do with my politics.,” X post, January 4, 2022,
10:03 p.m.; Aila Slisco, “Largest U.S. Bank Cuts Ties to

Conservative Group, Canceling Donald Trump Jr. Event,”
Newsweek, November 18, 2021; and Monica Miller, “Kanye
West: JP Morgan Chase Cuts Ties With Rapper,” BBC,
October 14, 2022.

27. “Trump Organization Sues Capital One for Closing Bank
Accounts After Jan. 6 Attack on US Capitol,” Associated
Press, March 7,2025.

28. Speaking anonymously, bankers told the New York Post
that regulators pressured them to drop accounts related
to Trump. However, more evidence is needed to verify
these claims. Charles Gasparino, “Inside the Enormous
Biden Effort to ‘Debank’ Trump After Jan. 6,” New York Post,
August 9, 2025; and “Trump Organization Sues Capital
One for Closing Bank Accounts After Jan. 6 Attack on US
Capitol,” Associated Press, March 7, 2025. Eric Trump
(@EricTrump), “Today, the Trump Organization filed a
lawsuit in Miami-Dade County against @CapitalOne to
hold the bank accountable for their egregious conduct in
unjustifiably terminating over 300 of the company’s bank
accounts without cause, in 2021. The decision by Capital
One to ‘debank’ our company, after well over a decade,
was a clear attack on free speech and free enterprise that
flies in the face of the bedrock principles and freedoms
that define our country. Moreover, the arbitrary closure of
these accounts, without justifiable cause, reflects a broader
effort to silence and undermine the success of the Trump
Organization and those who dare to express their political
views. By filing this lawsuit, we seek to hold Capital One
accountable for the millions of dollars in damages they
caused, not just to our company, but to the many dozens of
properties, hundreds of tenants and thousands of Trump
Organization employees who relied on these accounts for
their livelihoods. Businesses should not be targeted or
punished for their political affiliations. The actions taken
by Capital One and other major financial institutions
represents a dangerous precedent that could threaten

the operations of countless businesses across the nation,
particularly those with a strong and independent voice.
This lawsuit, and those that follow, are necessary steps to
protect the integrity of American business practices and to
ensure that no company or individual is unfairly targeted
for their beliefs, affiliations, or business activities. We

will not stand by while big banks misuse their power to
stifle businesses and harm innocent Americans,” X post,
March 7,2025,12:20 p.m.

29. Todd J. Zywicki, “Political Debanking,” George Mason
Law & Economics Research Paper No. 25-04, March 8, 2025.

30. Kerry Picket, “Banks Close Accounts, Slam Doors

on Jan. 6 Rioters; Feds Accused of Terrorist Treatment,”
Washington Times, March 24, 2023.

11


https://www.reuters.com/article/business/jpmorgan-backs-away-from-private-prison-finance-idUSKCN1QM1LW/
https://www.reuters.com/article/business/jpmorgan-backs-away-from-private-prison-finance-idUSKCN1QM1LW/
https://www.reuters.com/article/business/jpmorgan-backs-away-from-private-prison-finance-idUSKCN1QM1LW/
https://www.reuters.com/article/business/jpmorgan-backs-away-from-private-prison-finance-idUSKCN1QM1LW/
https://www.cnbc.com/2018/12/04/jamie-dimon-interrupted-twice-by-shouting-protesters-at-goldman-financial-conference.html
https://www.cnbc.com/2018/12/04/jamie-dimon-interrupted-twice-by-shouting-protesters-at-goldman-financial-conference.html
https://www.bloomberg.com/news/articles/2019-03-05/jpmorgan-ends-financing-of-private-prisons-following-criticism?embedded-checkout=true
https://www.bloomberg.com/news/articles/2019-03-05/jpmorgan-ends-financing-of-private-prisons-following-criticism?embedded-checkout=true
https://www.foxbusiness.com/video/6377459030112
https://www.foxbusiness.com/video/6377459030112
https://www.foxbusiness.com/video/6377459030112
https://www.realclearmarkets.com/articles/2025/05/05/us_bank_canceled_my_organizations_account_without_explaining_why_1107560.html
https://www.realclearmarkets.com/articles/2025/05/05/us_bank_canceled_my_organizations_account_without_explaining_why_1107560.html
https://www.realclearmarkets.com/articles/2025/05/05/us_bank_canceled_my_organizations_account_without_explaining_why_1107560.html
https://familycouncil.org/?p=25159
https://familycouncil.org/?p=25159
https://familycouncil.org/?p=25159
https://flvoicenews.com/retail-health-company-has-chase-accounts-suddenly-terminated-owner-critical-of-covid-vaccines-fda/
https://flvoicenews.com/retail-health-company-has-chase-accounts-suddenly-terminated-owner-critical-of-covid-vaccines-fda/
https://flvoicenews.com/retail-health-company-has-chase-accounts-suddenly-terminated-owner-critical-of-covid-vaccines-fda/
https://x.com/michaeljknowles/status/1947433739790733691
https://x.com/DanaRohrabacher/status/1882625058050359482
https://flvoicenews.com/paypal-unfreezes-moms-for-liberty-funds-after-desantis-announces-crackdown-on-woke-banking/
https://flvoicenews.com/paypal-unfreezes-moms-for-liberty-funds-after-desantis-announces-crackdown-on-woke-banking/
https://x.com/ianmiles/status/1478562720525946884
https://www.newsweek.com/largest-us-bank-cuts-ties-conservative-group-canceling-donald-trump-jr-event-1650599
https://www.newsweek.com/largest-us-bank-cuts-ties-conservative-group-canceling-donald-trump-jr-event-1650599
https://www.bbc.com/news/business-63252035
https://www.bbc.com/news/business-63252035
https://apnews.com/article/trump-bank-lawsuit-florida-28c05cfbf837b258b2018bfa3f02c0c4
https://apnews.com/article/trump-bank-lawsuit-florida-28c05cfbf837b258b2018bfa3f02c0c4
https://nypost.com/2025/08/09/business/gasparino-inside-the-enormous-biden-effort-to-debank-trump-after-jan-6/
https://nypost.com/2025/08/09/business/gasparino-inside-the-enormous-biden-effort-to-debank-trump-after-jan-6/
https://apnews.com/article/trump-bank-lawsuit-florida-28c05cfbf837b258b2018bfa3f02c0c4
https://apnews.com/article/trump-bank-lawsuit-florida-28c05cfbf837b258b2018bfa3f02c0c4
https://apnews.com/article/trump-bank-lawsuit-florida-28c05cfbf837b258b2018bfa3f02c0c4
https://x.com/EricTrump/status/1898061264968204332
https://x.com/EricTrump/status/1898061264968204332
https://papers.ssrn.com/sol3/papers.cfm?abstract_id=5173173
https://www.washingtontimes.com/news/2023/mar/24/de-banked-jan-6-defendants-get-terrorist-treatment/
https://www.washingtontimes.com/news/2023/mar/24/de-banked-jan-6-defendants-get-terrorist-treatment/

31. Michael Knowles (@michaeljknowles), “Hi, @Stripe.

Are we still doing this de-banking thing? Was it something

I said? If we say that men can’t be women, if we donate to
pro-life charities, if we oppose two men buying eggs, renting
wombs, and commoditizing babies. . . . Does that come at
the cost of de-banking?,” X post, July 21, 2025, 7:09 p.m.

32. Michael Knowles (@michaeljknowles), “10/ Of course,
I've never encouraged ‘unlawful violence’ against anyone.
But in the absence of any real explanation from Stripe, I
can only conclude that they’ve now decided that certain
conservative opinions amount to ‘illegal’ activity,” X post,
July 21,2025, 7:09 p.m.

33. Michael Knowles (@michaeljknowles), “I'm pleased

to say Stripe has reached out to resolve this strange

issue, which appears to have begun with a government
administrative error rather than intentional de-banking. As
we investigate, I'm even more pleased to say that we're also
exploring legislative solutions to the lack of transparency
that often makes these issues unresolvable for countless
Americans. Will discuss more on the show and keep
everyone posted as this develops,” X post, July 22, 2025,
4:28 p.m.

34. Kelly Loeffler, Ian Miles Cheong, the Constitution Party
of Idaho, Mercola Market, the Arkansas Family Council,
Moms for Liberty, and the Defense of Liberty Foundation
have all claimed to have been debanked for political reasons.
Kelly Loeffler, “Political Redlining: Kelly Loeffler Vows to
‘Get to the Bottom’ of Politicized Debanking,” interview by
Larry Kudlow, Kudlow, Fox News, August 26, 2025; Michael
Knowles (@michaeljknowles), “Hi, @Stripe. Are we still
doing this de-banking thing? Was it something I said?

If we say that men can’t be women, if we donate to pro-

life charities, if we oppose two men buying eggs, renting
wombs, and commoditizing babies. . . . Does that come at
the cost of de-banking?,” X post, July 21,2025, 7:09 p.m.;
Tony Ulrich, “U.S. Bank Canceled My Organization’s Account
Without Explaining Why,” RealClearMarkets, May 5, 2024;
Jerry Cox, “Chase Bank Cancels National Committee for
Religious Freedom’s Account Just Like it Canceled Family
Council’s,” Family Council, October 19, 2022; Brendon Leslie,
“Retail Health Company Has Chase Accounts Suddenly
Terminated, Owner Critical of COIVD Vaccines, FDA,”
Florida’s Voice, last updated August 1, 2023; Lydia Nusbaum,
“PayPal Unfreezes Moms for Liberty Funds After DeSantis
Announces Crackdown on ‘Woke’ Banking,” Florida’s Voice,
August 1, 2022; Ian Miles Cheong (@ianmiles), “PayPal

just informed me that they have permanently banned

my account. Without giving an explicit reason why, the
supervisor was extremely rude and implied that it had
everything to do with my politics.,” X post, January 4, 2022,
10:03 p.m.; and Aila Slisco, “Largest US Bank Cuts Ties to

12

Conservative Group, Canceling Donald Trump Jr. Event,”
Newsweek, last updated November 19, 2021.

35. Nicholas Anthony, “Trump’s Debanking Order Calls for
Investigation, Something Tennessee Should Have Done,”
Cato at Liberty (blog), Cato Institute, August 7, 2025.

36. Based on public reporting, there have been atleast

four claims of religious debanking in recent years. The
affected parties include Indigenous Advance Ministries,

the National Committee for Religious Freedom, the Ruth
Institute, and Timothy Two Project International. Although
the case with Lance Wallnau Ministries is commonly cited,
no account closure took place. Instead, the account was
frozen and released once security questions related to
money laundering concerns were answered. Kate Quifiones,
“CNA Explains: What Is ‘Debanking’ and How Does It

Affect Catholics?,” Catholic News Agency, March 25, 2025;
Alliance Defending Freedom, “Bank of America Boots
Charity Serving Impoverished Ugandans Under Vague ‘Risk
Tolerance’ Policies,” August 22, 2023; Sam Brownback, “Big
Banks Discriminate Against Christian Ministries, Churches,”
Washington Times, May 2, 2024; Steve Warren, “Bank of
America Freezes Ministry Account of Lance Wallnau in Latest
Case of Banks Canceling Christians,” Christian Broadcasting
Network, March, 13,2023; and Steve Curtis, “Why Is Bank of
America Canceling the Accounts of Religious Organizations?,”
Washington Examiner, November 12, 2023.

37. The closed accounts were for Indigenous Advance
Ministries (a nonprofit ministry in Tennessee), Indigenous
Advance Customer Center (a for-profit debt-collection
agency in Uganda), World Shine USA Corporation,
University House of Prayer, and Servants of Christ
Community. The same person controlled all the accounts,
and public records show that at least four of the entities
are registered to him at a residential address. Bank of
America to World Shine USA Corporation, DBA Indigenous
Advance, Steven Happ, Indigenous Advance Customer
Center, Servants of Christ Community, and University
House of Prayer, “Account Closure Letters,” April 2023; and
“Searches,” Tennessee Secretary of State, 2025.

38. Alliance Defending Freedom, “Bank of America Boots
Charity Serving Impoverished Ugandans Under Vague ‘Risk
Tolerance’ Policies,” August 22, 2023.

39. Although it has since been removed, Indigenous Advance
Ministries used to feature something called “IACC” on

its website. The acronym stood for “Indigenous Advance
Customer Center.” This business offered services that
included helping “clean books” and pursuing “the recovery
of overdue invoices.” Not only is that a high-risk business in a
high-risk jurisdiction, but the bank also said the organization


https://x.com/michaeljknowles/status/1947433739790733691
https://x.com/michaeljknowles/status/1947433826088603985
https://x.com/michaeljknowles/status/1947755668384940420
https://www.foxbusiness.com/video/6377459030112
https://www.foxbusiness.com/video/6377459030112
https://x.com/michaeljknowles/status/1947433739790733691
https://x.com/michaeljknowles/status/1947433739790733691
https://www.realclearmarkets.com/articles/2025/05/05/us_bank_canceled_my_organizations_account_without_explaining_why_1107560.html
https://www.realclearmarkets.com/articles/2025/05/05/us_bank_canceled_my_organizations_account_without_explaining_why_1107560.html
https://familycouncil.org/?p=25159
https://familycouncil.org/?p=25159
https://familycouncil.org/?p=25159
https://flvoicenews.com/retail-health-company-has-chase-accounts-suddenly-terminated-owner-critical-of-covid-vaccines-fda/
https://flvoicenews.com/retail-health-company-has-chase-accounts-suddenly-terminated-owner-critical-of-covid-vaccines-fda/
https://flvoicenews.com/paypal-unfreezes-moms-for-liberty-funds-after-desantis-announces-crackdown-on-woke-banking/
https://flvoicenews.com/paypal-unfreezes-moms-for-liberty-funds-after-desantis-announces-crackdown-on-woke-banking/
https://x.com/ianmiles/status/1478562720525946884
https://www.newsweek.com/largest-us-bank-cuts-ties-conservative-group-canceling-donald-trump-jr-event-1650599
https://www.newsweek.com/largest-us-bank-cuts-ties-conservative-group-canceling-donald-trump-jr-event-1650599
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://www.catholicnewsagency.com/news/262917/cna-explains-what-is-debanking-and-how-does-it-affect-catholics
https://www.catholicnewsagency.com/news/262917/cna-explains-what-is-debanking-and-how-does-it-affect-catholics
https://adflegal.org/press-release/bank-america-boots-charity-serving-impoverished-ugandans-under-vague-risk-tolerance/
https://adflegal.org/press-release/bank-america-boots-charity-serving-impoverished-ugandans-under-vague-risk-tolerance/
https://adflegal.org/press-release/bank-america-boots-charity-serving-impoverished-ugandans-under-vague-risk-tolerance/
https://www.washingtontimes.com/news/2024/may/2/big-banks-discriminate-against-christian-ministrie/
https://www.washingtontimes.com/news/2024/may/2/big-banks-discriminate-against-christian-ministrie/
https://cbn.com/news/us/bank-america-freezes-ministry-account-lance-wallnau-latest-case-banks-canceling-christians
https://cbn.com/news/us/bank-america-freezes-ministry-account-lance-wallnau-latest-case-banks-canceling-christians
https://cbn.com/news/us/bank-america-freezes-ministry-account-lance-wallnau-latest-case-banks-canceling-christians
https://www.washingtonexaminer.com/opinion/beltway-confidential/2748853/why-is-bank-of-america-canceling-the-accounts-of-religious-organizations/
https://www.washingtonexaminer.com/opinion/beltway-confidential/2748853/why-is-bank-of-america-canceling-the-accounts-of-religious-organizations/
https://web.archive.org/web/20240315212817/https:/dm1l19z832j5m.cloudfront.net/public/2023-08/Indigenous-Advance-2023-04-24-Account-Closure-Letters.pdf
https://tncab.tnsos.gov/public-searches
https://adflegal.org/press-release/bank-america-boots-charity-serving-impoverished-ugandans-under-vague-risk-tolerance/
https://adflegal.org/press-release/bank-america-boots-charity-serving-impoverished-ugandans-under-vague-risk-tolerance/
https://adflegal.org/press-release/bank-america-boots-charity-serving-impoverished-ugandans-under-vague-risk-tolerance/

“didn’t disclose that one of the accounts was tied to a business
in Uganda.” “Welcome to Indigenous Advance Ministries,”
Indigenous Advance Ministries, archived March 23, 2024;
“Indigenous Advance Customer Center,” IACC, archived
September 1, 2023; and Alexander Saeedy and Dylan Tokar,
“An Evangelical’s Story Fueled Trump’s Fight Against Banks,”
Wall Street Journal, September 17, 2025.

40. Alexander Saeedy and Dylan Tokar, “An Evangelical’s
Story Fueled Trump’s Fight Against Banks,” Wall Street
Journal, September 17, 2025.

41. The case of the National Committee for Religious
Freedom is sometimes described as a case of political
discrimination, and other times it’s described as a case of
religious discrimination. Reports, however, tend to lean
toward the latter description.

42. Sam Brownback, “Big Banks Discriminate Against
Christian Ministries, Churches,” Washington Times, May 2,
2024.

43. Andrew Schwartz, “Tennessee Bill Fights Religious
Discrimination in Banking. Critics Say It’s a Solution
in Search of a Problem,” Chattanooga Times Free Press,
February 27, 2024.

44. Nupur Anand, “JPMorgan Denied It Closed Account
Linked to Former Kansas Governor on Religious Grounds,
Letter Shows,” Reuters, August 8, 2025; and Board of
Governors of the Federal Reserve System, Federal Deposit
Insurance Corporation, Financial Crimes Enforcement
Network, National Credit Union Administration, and Office
of the Comptroller of the Currency, “Joint Fact Sheet on Bank
Secrecy Act Due Diligence Requirements for Charities and
Non-Profit Organizations,” November 19, 2020.

45. Youssef Chouhoud, “Banking While Muslim: From
Closed Accounts and Denied Transactions to Investigations,
Muslims Are the Most Likely Faith Group to Report
Challenges with Financial Institutions,” Institute for Social
Policy and Understanding, March 14, 2023.

46.In a 2025 study, the Muslim Charities Forum found
that issues with maintaining accounts were “particularly
pronounced for charities working in high-risk regions or
conflict zones.” Abdulsami Arjumand et al., The Landscape
of Debanking Within Muslim Charities and Its Impact On
Charitable Activities (Muslim Charities Forum, January 14,
2025).

47. Plymouth Union Public Research to Interested Parties,
“Republicans Sour on Anti-Debanking Legislation,”
memorandum, March 11, 2025.

48. Ross Kerber, “Just 35 Complaints of Debanking Cite
Political Bias Despite Trump Order,” Reuters, August 19,
2025.

49. Nicholas Anthony, “Trump’s Debanking Order Calls for
Investigation, Something Tennessee Should Have Done,”
Cato at Liberty (blog), Cato Institute, August 7, 2025.

50. Nicholas Anthony, “Trump’s Debanking Order Calls for
Investigation, Something Tennessee Should Have Done,”
Cato at Liberty (blog), Cato Institute, August 7, 2025.

51. Plymouth Union Public Research to Interested Parties,
“Republicans Sour on Anti-Debanking Legislation,”
memorandum, March 11, 2025.

52. Nicholas Anthony, “Fair Access to Banking,” Cato
Institute Working Paper no. 84, January 1, 2025.

53. Nicholas Anthony, “Trump’s Debanking Order Calls for
Investigation, Something Tennessee Should Have Done,”
Cato at Liberty (blog), Cato Institute, August 7, 2025.

54. Tara Siegel Bernard and Ron Lieber, “Banks Are Closing
Customer Accounts, With Little Explanation,” New York Times,
April 8,2023; Ron Lieber and Tara Siegel Bernard, “Why Banks
Are Suddenly Closing Down Customer Accounts,” New York
Times, November 5,2023; Rupa Subramanya, “The Debanking
of America,” Free Press, October 17, 2024; and Bank Policy
Institute Staff, “The Truth About Suspicious Activity Reports,”
Bank Policy Institute, September 22, 2020.

55. Tara Siegel Bernard and Ron Lieber, “Banks Are Closing
Customer Accounts, With Little Explanation,” New York Times,
April 8,2023; Ron Lieber and Tara Siegel Bernard, “Why Banks
Are Suddenly Closing Down Customer Accounts,” New York
Times, November 5,2023; Rupa Subramanya, “The Debanking
of America,” Free Press, October 17, 2024; and Bank Policy
Institute Staff, “The Truth About Suspicious Activity Reports,”
Bank Policy Institute, September 22, 2020.

56. Bank Policy Institute Staff, “The Truth About Suspicious
Activity Reports,” Bank Policy Institute, September 22, 2020.

57. Peter Conti-Brown, “The Curse of Confidential
Supervisory Information,” Brookings Institution, December
20,2019.

58. Another issue to consider is that of matters requiring
attention (commonly abbreviated as MRAs). However,
they are a more complicated matter given that “MRAs
have no origin or even reference in law or regulation;
rather, they have grown up as an informal convention in
the examination process, and since taken formal root.”

13


https://web.archive.org/web/20240323170558/https:/indigenousadvance.org/
https://web.archive.org/web/20230901185310/https:/iacustomercenter.com/
https://www.wsj.com/finance/regulation/debanking-banks-bias-92135ef9
https://www.wsj.com/finance/regulation/debanking-banks-bias-92135ef9
https://www.wsj.com/finance/regulation/debanking-banks-bias-92135ef9
https://www.washingtontimes.com/news/2024/may/2/big-banks-discriminate-against-christian-ministrie/
https://www.washingtontimes.com/news/2024/may/2/big-banks-discriminate-against-christian-ministrie/
https://www.timesfreepress.com/news/2024/feb/27/tennessee-bill-fights-religious-discrimination-in/
https://www.timesfreepress.com/news/2024/feb/27/tennessee-bill-fights-religious-discrimination-in/
https://www.timesfreepress.com/news/2024/feb/27/tennessee-bill-fights-religious-discrimination-in/
https://www.reuters.com/sustainability/society-equity/jpmorgan-denied-it-closed-account-linked-former-kansas-governor-religious-2025-08-07/
https://www.reuters.com/sustainability/society-equity/jpmorgan-denied-it-closed-account-linked-former-kansas-governor-religious-2025-08-07/
https://www.reuters.com/sustainability/society-equity/jpmorgan-denied-it-closed-account-linked-former-kansas-governor-religious-2025-08-07/
https://www.fincen.gov/system/files/shared/Charities%20Fact%20Sheet%2011_19_20.pdf
https://www.fincen.gov/system/files/shared/Charities%20Fact%20Sheet%2011_19_20.pdf
https://www.fincen.gov/system/files/shared/Charities%20Fact%20Sheet%2011_19_20.pdf
https://ispu.org/banking-while-muslim/
https://ispu.org/banking-while-muslim/
https://ispu.org/banking-while-muslim/
https://ispu.org/banking-while-muslim/
https://www.muslimcharitiesforum.org.uk/resources/the-landscape-of-debanking-within-muslim-charities-and-its-impact-on-charitable-activities/
https://www.muslimcharitiesforum.org.uk/resources/the-landscape-of-debanking-within-muslim-charities-and-its-impact-on-charitable-activities/
https://www.muslimcharitiesforum.org.uk/resources/the-landscape-of-debanking-within-muslim-charities-and-its-impact-on-charitable-activities/
https://pup-research.com/polling-memo/republicans-sour-on-anti-debanking-legislation/
https://www.reuters.com/legal/transactional/just-35-complaints-debanking-cite-political-bias-despite-trump-order-2025-08-19/
https://www.reuters.com/legal/transactional/just-35-complaints-debanking-cite-political-bias-despite-trump-order-2025-08-19/
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://pup-research.com/polling-memo/republicans-sour-on-anti-debanking-legislation/
https://www.cato.org/working-paper/fair-access-banking
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://www.nytimes.com/2023/04/08/your-money/bank-account-suspicious-activity.html
https://www.nytimes.com/2023/04/08/your-money/bank-account-suspicious-activity.html
https://www.nytimes.com/2023/11/05/business/banks-accounts-close-suddenly.html
https://www.nytimes.com/2023/11/05/business/banks-accounts-close-suddenly.html
https://www.thefp.com/p/debanking-america-melania-barron-trump-january-6-muslims
https://www.thefp.com/p/debanking-america-melania-barron-trump-january-6-muslims
https://bpi.com/the-truth-about-suspicious-activity-reports/
https://www.nytimes.com/2023/04/08/your-money/bank-account-suspicious-activity.html
https://www.nytimes.com/2023/04/08/your-money/bank-account-suspicious-activity.html
https://www.nytimes.com/2023/11/05/business/banks-accounts-close-suddenly.html
https://www.nytimes.com/2023/11/05/business/banks-accounts-close-suddenly.html
https://www.thefp.com/p/debanking-america-melania-barron-trump-january-6-muslims
https://www.thefp.com/p/debanking-america-melania-barron-trump-january-6-muslims
https://bpi.com/the-truth-about-suspicious-activity-reports/
https://bpi.com/the-truth-about-suspicious-activity-reports/
https://bpi.com/the-truth-about-suspicious-activity-reports/
https://www.brookings.edu/articles/the-curse-of-confidential-supervisory-information/
https://www.brookings.edu/articles/the-curse-of-confidential-supervisory-information/

Greg Baer and Jeremy Newell, “The MRA is the Core of
Supervision, but Common Standards and Practices Are MIA,”
Bank Policy Institute, February 8, 2018.

59. Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve System,
“Federal Reserve Board Announces that Reputational Risk
Will No Longer Be a Component of Examination Programs
in Its Supervision of Banks,” press release, June 23, 2025;
Office of the Comptroller of the Currency, “OCC Ceases
Examinations for Reputation Risk,” news release, March 20,
2025; Travis Hill, “View from the FDIC: Update on Key Policy
Issues,” speech, American Bankers Association Washington
Summit, April 8, 2025; and Exec. Order No. 14331, 90 Fed.
Reg. 38925 (August 7, 2025).

60. This language is modified from Financial Institution
Customer Protection Act of 2017, H.R. 2706, 115th Cong.,

1st Sess., No. 115-2706 (2017); and Committee on Banking,
Housing, and Urban Affairs, FIRM Act, 119th Cong., st Sess.,
No. 119-875 (2025).

61. Norbert Michel and Jennifer J. Schulp, “Revising the Bank

Secrecy Act to Protect Privacy and Deter Criminals,” Cato
Institute Policy Analysis no. 932, July 26, 2022.

14

62 Nicholas Anthony, “Reporting FinCEN’s Suspicious
Activity, Again,” Cato at Liberty (blog), Cato Institute, July 9,
2025.

63. These recommendations are modified from Norbert
Michel and Jennifer J. Schulp, “Revising the Bank Secrecy Act
to Protect Privacy and Deter Criminals,” Cato Institute Policy
Analysis no. 932, July 26, 2022.

64. These recommendations are modified from Norbert
Michel and Jennifer J. Schulp, “Revising the Bank Secrecy Act
to Protect Privacy and Deter Criminals,” Cato Institute Policy
Analysis no. 932, July 26, 2022.

65. Nicholas Anthony, “Banks Are Narcing on You Because
Congress Forces Them To,” Reason Magazine, February 2025,
p. 8; Jorge Jraissati, “Combating Transnational Financial
Repression: Evidence for Reforming AML/CFT Laws,”
Economic Inclusion Group, January 2025; Government
Accountability Office, “Bank Secrecy Act: Derisking Along
the Southwest Border Highlights Need for Regulators to
Enhance Retrospective Reviews,” February 26, 2018; and
Nicholas Anthony, “Fair Access to Banking,” Cato Institute
Working Paper no. 84, January 1, 2025.


https://bpi.com/the-mra-is-the-core-of-supervision-but-common-standards-and-practices-are-mia/
https://bpi.com/the-mra-is-the-core-of-supervision-but-common-standards-and-practices-are-mia/
https://www.federalreserve.gov/newsevents/pressreleases/bcreg20250623a.htm
https://www.federalreserve.gov/newsevents/pressreleases/bcreg20250623a.htm
https://www.federalreserve.gov/newsevents/pressreleases/bcreg20250623a.htm
https://www.occ.gov/news-issuances/news-releases/2025/nr-occ-2025-21.html
https://www.occ.gov/news-issuances/news-releases/2025/nr-occ-2025-21.html
https://www.fdic.gov/news/speeches/2025/view-fdic-update-key-policy-issues
https://www.fdic.gov/news/speeches/2025/view-fdic-update-key-policy-issues
https://www.federalregister.gov/documents/2025/08/12/2025-15341/guaranteeing-fair-banking-for-all-americans
https://www.federalregister.gov/documents/2025/08/12/2025-15341/guaranteeing-fair-banking-for-all-americans
https://www.congress.gov/bill/115th-congress/house-bill/2706
https://www.congress.gov/bill/115th-congress/house-bill/2706
https://www.congress.gov/bill/119th-congress/senate-bill/875/text
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/revising-bank-secrecy-act-protect-privacy-deter-criminals
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/revising-bank-secrecy-act-protect-privacy-deter-criminals
https://www.cato.org/blog/reporting-fincens-suspicious-activity-again
https://www.cato.org/blog/reporting-fincens-suspicious-activity-again
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/revising-bank-secrecy-act-protect-privacy-deter-criminals
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/revising-bank-secrecy-act-protect-privacy-deter-criminals
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/revising-bank-secrecy-act-protect-privacy-deter-criminals
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/revising-bank-secrecy-act-protect-privacy-deter-criminals
https://www.cato.org/commentary/banks-are-narcing-you-because-congress-forces-them
https://www.cato.org/commentary/banks-are-narcing-you-because-congress-forces-them
https://efile.fara.gov/docs/7246-Informational-Materials-20250501-82.pdf
https://efile.fara.gov/docs/7246-Informational-Materials-20250501-82.pdf
https://www.gao.gov/products/gao-18-263
https://www.gao.gov/products/gao-18-263
https://www.gao.gov/products/gao-18-263
https://www.cato.org/working-paper/fair-access-banking

RELATED PUBLICATIONS FROM THE CATO INSTITUTE

Congress Dissects Debanking in New Report by Nicholas Anthony, Cato at Liberty (blog)
(December 5, 2025)

Trump Debanks the Left? Antifa Terrorist Designation Means New Pressure by Nicholas Anthony,
Cato at Liberty (blog) (November 13, 2025)

Debanking and the Need for Transparency by Nicholas Anthony, Testimony Before the European
Parliament (September 2, 2025)

Breaking Down Trump's Debanking Executive Order by Nicholas Anthony, Cato at Liberty (blog)
(August 8, 2025)

Trump's Debanking Order Calls for Investigation, Something Tennessee Should Have Done by
Nicholas Anthony, Cato at Liberty (blog) (August 7, 2025)

Two Types of Debanking: Operational and Governmental by Nicholas Anthony, Cato at Liberty (blog)
(February 4, 2025)

Fair Access to Banking by Nicholas Anthony, Working Paper no. 84 (January 1, 2025)

Is Operation Choke Point Back and Targeting Cryptocurrencies? by Nicholas Anthony, Cato at
Liberty (blog) (February 23, 2023)


https://www.cato.org/blog/congress-dissects-debanking-new-report
https://www.cato.org/blog/trump-debanks-left-antifa-terrorist-designation-means-new-pressure
https://www.cato.org/testimony/debanking-need-transparency
https://www.cato.org/blog/breaking-down-trumps-debanking-executive-order
https://www.cato.org/blog/trumps-debanking-order-calls-investigation-something-tennessee-should-have-done
https://www.cato.org/blog/two-types-debanking-operational-governmental
https://www.cato.org/working-paper/fair-access-banking
https://www.cato.org/blog/operation-chokepoint-back-targeting-cryptocurrencies

RECENT STUDIES IN THE
CATO INSTITUTE POLICY ANALYSIS SERIES

1008. Better Long-Term Care for Billions Less by Stephen A. Moses (November 13, 2025)
1007. Steeled for Protectionism by Clark Packard and Alfredo Carrillo Obregon (October 30, 2025)

1006. Their Own Two Feet: How Europeans Can Lead on Conventional Deterrence in Europe by
Benjamin David Giltner (October 23, 2025)

1005. Licensing Requirements Would Block Care and Justice for Sexual Assault Victims by

Jeffrey A. Singer, Akiva Malamet, Spencer Pratt, and Michael F. Cannon (October 1, 2025)

1004. The $15 Trillion Emergency Spending Loophole Federal Emergency Spending: 1991-2025
by Dominik Lett (September 16, 2025)

1003. Immigrants Cut Victimization Rates, Boost Crime Reporting by David J. Bier and Julian
Salazar (August 26, 2025)

1002. Reforming Federal Laws on Private Sector Labor Unions by Charles W. Baird (July 29, 2025)

1001. Unnecessary Relics: The Surgeon General and the Public Health Service Commissioned
Corps by Jeffrey A. Singer, Akiva Malamet, Bautista Vivanco, and Michael F. Cannon (July 22,
2025)

1000. Aimless Rivalry: The Futility of US-China Competition in the Middle East by Jon Hoffman
(July 10, 2025)

999. The Misleading Panic over Misinformation: And Why Government Solutions Won't Work by
David Inserra (June 24, 2025)

998. Rethinking Social Security from a Global Perspective: What Congress Can Learn from the
Experiences of Canada, Germany, New Zealand, and Sweden by Romina Boccia and lvane
Nachkebia (June 16, 2025)

997. Opportunity Costs of State and Local Al Regulation by Joshua Levine (June 10, 2025)

996. What Happens If the United States Leaves the WTO? by James Bacchus (June 3, 2025)

CITATION

Anthony, Nicholas. “Understanding Debanking: Evaluating Governmental, Operational, Political,
and Religious Financial Account Closures,” Policy Analysis no. 1009, Cato Institute, Washington, DC,
January 8, 2026.

The views expressed in this paper are those of the author(s) and should not be attributed to the Cato Institute, its directors,

its Partners, or any other person or organization. Nothing in this paper should be construed as an attempt to aid or hinder

the passage of any bill before Congress. Copyright © 2026 Cato Institute. This work by the Cato Institute is licensed under a
1NSTITUTE Creative Commons Attribution-NonCommercial-ShareAlike 4.0 International License.


https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/better-long-term-care-billions-less
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/expand-access-methadone-treatment
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/expand-access-methadone-treatment
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/expand-access-methadone-treatment
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/expand-access-methadone-treatment
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/understanding-debanking-evaluating-governmental-operational-political-religious
https://www.cato.org/policy-analysis/understanding-debanking-evaluating-governmental-operational-political-religious

